
From: McWilliams, Katherine
To: Deardoff, Amy
Subject: FW: Cane Island Estates LLC - Permit no. 4899-WR-3
Date: Monday, May 14, 2018 12:10:38 PM
Attachments: ADEQ Proof of payment and newspaper notice.pdf

4899-WR-3_Application Proof of Payment and Publication
 

From: Rusty Hames [mailto:rhames@nwark.com] 
Sent: Monday, May 14, 2018 11:06 AM
To: McWilliams, Katherine
Subject: Cane Island Estates LLC - Permit no. 4899-WR-3
 
I have attached the proof of publication and payment.  Is there anything else you need?
 
Thanks,
Danny Hames
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